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Match the words to the symbols:

God

the Church

Jesus Christ

the royalty of Jesus

the Body and Blood of Our Lord
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WORD POWER

LITURGY LINGO

Can you find the correct meaning of these
words from the Divine Liturgy?

1. litany—A. a service B. a series of prayers led
by the deacon to which the congregation
responds C. the first section of the liturgy

2. doxology—A. an ending to a prayer B. ten
litanies C. a history of the formation of the
liturgy
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3. hymn—A. opposite of her B. a poem from
the Old Testament C. a religious song

4. synaxis—A. the teaching portion of the liturgy
B. a list of sins C. the last section of the liturgy
5. "PROSCHOUMEN'"'—A. press you men B. at-
tention C. the cross above the altar !

6. vestments—A. money the church has invested
B. the outer hall of the church C. the clothing
the priest wears

7. nave—A. the part of the church where the
congregation sits B. the part of the church
where the choir stands C. a knight

8. eucharist—A. the "'mahs’ B. the recitation of
the general form for confession C. Holy
Communion

9. liturgy—A. a eucharistic ceremony B. a
church service C. a prayer or group of prayers
10. "DER VOGHORMYA"—A. a place where
people are buried B. a response used when
someone sneezes in church C. Lord, have mercy




